Tim Carroll

From: Melanie Becker [treasurer@chilmarkma.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2011 10:44 AM

To: Tim Carroll’

Subject: RE: STM

To see if the town will appropriate from available funds in the treasury $29,000 to fund the costs of
bonding (long-term borrowing) for the repair of damage caused by fire to the West Dock, including the
payment of costs incidental and related thereto.

From: Tim Carroll [mailto:execsec@chilmarkma.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, August 09, 2011 5:37 PM

To: 'Melanie Becker

Subject: RE: STM

Please send what you have for the agenda in draft idea form Friday.

Tim Carroll, Executive Secretary 508-645-2101 v 2110

My new Email Address is, tcarroll@chilmarkma.gov Please change @ci.chilmark.ma.us to @chilmarkma.gov for all Chilmark
addresses.

The Secretary of State's office has determined that most e-mails to and from municipal offices and officials are public records.
Consequently, confidentiality should not be expected.

From: Melanie Becker [mailto:treasurer@chilmarkma.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, August 09, 2011 5:13 PM

To: execsec@chilmarkma.gov

Subject: STM

When will be the cut date for warrant article for the STM?

Please note, my email address has been recently changed. Please update your address book to reflect my new
email address: treasurer@chilmarkma.gov

Melanie Becker

Treasurer

Town of Chilmark

401 Middle Road, PO Box 119
Chilmark, MA 02535-0119

The Secretary of State's office has determined that most e-mails to and from municipal offices and officials are
public records. Consequently, confidentiality should not be expected.
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